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Possible review case verdicts: 

• review case does not apply to the teY. objecL.

• review object does meet ::he requirement._ ....... 
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........ N(A.) 

. .... ..
P{ass) 

• review object does not mee:t the requirement. ............ F(ail) 

General re-marks: 

"(see remark #r refers to a remark appended to the repott.

"(see appended table)" refers to a table appended to the report. 

Throughout mis re-port a comma is used as the decimal separator. 

The review results presented in .his report re-ta:e onty to the object reviewed. 
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This repon shall no< be reproduced except in full wi1hout the written approval of the third party. 

Testing: 

Date of receipt of revie,w item: February 25,2020 

Oate(s) of perlormance of review: Febru.3.tY 25.2020 ::o March 04.2020 

General product information: 

Medical masks 

Summary of reviewing: 

This review report includes: 

Annex I: 4 page(s) of photo documentation. 

Marking 

Copy of marking plate 

Medical masks, 

Mode1A1 
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4 Classiflcation 

MedicaJ face masks specified in this European 
Standard are classified into two types (Type I and 

Type II) according to bacterial fi.ltration efficiency 
whereby Type II is further divided according to 

wheU\e.r or not :.he mask is splash resistanL The 
'R' signifies splash resistance. 

5 Requirements 

5.1 General 

5.t.1 Materials and construction 

The medical face mask is a medical device. 
generally composed of a filter layer that is placed. 
bonded or moul ded be:iween layers of fabric. The 
medical face mask shaU not disintegra:e. split Of 
tear during intended use. In the selection of the 
filter and layer ma,erials, artention shaO b-e paid to
cleanliness. 

5.1.2 De-sign 

The medical face mask shall have a means by 
which it can be fitted closely aver the nos.e. mouth 
and ch.in of the wearer and which ensures that the 
mask fits closely at the sides. 

Medical face masks may have different shapes 
and constructions as well as additional fe-a!ures 
such as a face shield (to protect the weare-r 
against splashes and droplets) wi1h or without anti• 
fog function, or a nose bridge (to enhance fit by 
confom,ing ::o the nose contours). 

5.2 Performance requirements 

5.2.1 General 

AD tests shalt be ca.tried out on finished products 
or samples cut from finished products. 

5.22 Bacterial filtration efficiency (SFE) 

When tested in accordance with Annex B. the SFE 
of the medical face mask shall conform to the 

minimum value given for the relevant type in Table 
I. 

For thick and rigid masks such as rigid duckbill or 
cup masks the test meUlod may not be s11.1itabJe as 
a proper seal cannot be maintained in the cascade 
impactor. In these cases. another val id equivalent 

method shaU be u-sed ::o determine die SFE. 

When a mask oonsis'!S of two or more areas with 
different characteristics or dJfferent laye-r-

composition, each panel or area shafJ be tested 
individually. The lowest performing panel or area 
shaU determine tlie SfE value of the compte:e 
mask. 

5.2.3 Breathabl1ity 

When tested in accordance with Annex C, the 
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differential pressure of the medical face mask shall 

conform to the value given for the relevant type in 
Table 1. 

If the use of a respiratory protective devioe as faoe 
mask is required in an operating theatre andlor 
other medical settings. it might not fulfil the 
performanoe requirements with regard to 
differential pressure as defined in this European 
Standard. In such case. the device should fulfil the 

requirement as specified in the relevant  Personal 
Protective Equipment {PPE) standard(s). 

5.2.4 Splash resistance 

When tested in accordance ,,.;th ISO 22609:2004 
the resistance of the medical face mask to 
penetration of splashes of liquid shall conform to 
the minimum value given for Type UR in T.able l. 

5.2.5 Microbial cleanliness {Bioburde-n)

When tested according to EN ISO 11737-1:2018 
the bioburde-n of the medical mask shaU be t;; 30 
CFU/g tested (see Tabte 1). 

To determine the mask·s bioburden according to 
EN ISO t 1737-1:2018, refer to the procedure as 

described in Annex 0. 

The number of masks that shaB be tested is 
minimum 5 of .he same batch/lot.. 

other ::est conditions as described in EN tSO 
11737-1:2018 may be applied. 
In the ,est report. indicate the to;ai bioburclen per 
individual mask and based on the mask weight. 
the total bioburden per gram. 

5.2.6 Biocompatibility 

According to the definition and classificati,on in EN 
ISO t0993-1:200g, a medical face mask i s  a 
surface device with limited- contact. The 
manufacturer shall complete the evaluation of the 
medfoal face mask according to EN ISO 10993-
1 :2009 and de:iennine the appl icable toxicology 
test ing regime. The resu1�s of testi-ng should be 
documented according to the appricable parts of 
the EN ISO 10993 series. The test results shall be 
,wailable upon request. 

5.2.7 Summary of perlormance requirements 
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Marting, labelfrng and packaging 

Annex I. § 13, oi the Medical Devices Directive 
(93/42/EEC) or Annex I. § 23. of the Medical 
Device Regulation (EU) 20l7n45 specifies the 
information that should be specified on the 
packaging in which the medJCaJ face mask is 
supplied. 

The following information shaO be suppriecl: 

a) number of this European Standard:

b) type of mask (as indicated in Tabfe 1 ).

c) EN ISO 15223-1:2016 Md EN
1041 :2008+A 1 :2013 shouJd be cons.idered.

- End of Review Report -
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